ABSTRACT OF BIDS:

Sheffield Readiness Center Re-roof

Sheffield, AL
IFB # AC-11-B-0014-S
August 11, 2011 at 2:00 pm

BIDDERS BASE BID TOTAL
MG Roofing, Inc.
Muscle Shoals, A% NO BID NO BID
Standard Roofing of Montgomery, Inc. $ 179.340.00 179.340.00
Pelham, AL ! ' Y '
Hale Building Company, Inc. $ 240,227.00 240,227.00
Anniston, AL
ACME Roofing & Sheet Metal $ 148.900.00 148.900.00
Dothan, AL ! ' ! )
Alabama Roofing & Sheet Metal $ 176.354.00 176.354.00
Anniston, AL ’ ' ! )
Ben Hill Roofing & Siding Company, Inc.
Douglasville, GA g g p Y NO BID NO BID
Interstate Roofing, Inc. $ 196.400.00 196.400.00
Montgomery, AL ’ . ’ .
CALENCO,LLC
el NO BID NO BID
Atlas Builders & Roofing, Inc. $ 192.930.00 192.930.00
Killen, AL ree e
GKL Companies, Inc.
AL $ 199,440.00 199,440.00
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