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ABSTRACT OF BIDS:

....
BIDDERS BASE BID ALTERNATE #1 TOTAL

MG Roofing, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID
Muscle Shoals, AL

Standard Roofing of Montgomery, Inc. $ 290,350.00 $ 5,000.00 $ 295,350.00
Pelham, AL

Hale Building Company, Inc. $ 390,039.00 $ 2,881.00 $ 392,920.00
Anniston, AL

Double AA Construction Company $ 275,000.00 $ 6,400.00 $ 281,400.00
Wilmer, AL

ACME Roofing & Sheet Metal $ 260,000.00 $ 3,600.00 $ 263,600.00
Dothan, AL

Alabama Roofing & Sheet Metal $ 307,554.00 $ 3,800.00 $ 311,354.00
Anniston, AL

Ben Hill Roofing & Siding Company, Inc. $ 300,500.00 $ 8,750.00 $ 309,250.00
Douglasville, GA

Interstate Roofing, Inc. $ 275,500.00 $ 4,000.00 $ 279,500.00
Montgomery, AL

CALENCO,LLC NO BID NO BID NO BID
Sheffield, AL

Atlas Builders & Roofing, Inc. $ 347,999.00 $ 50,000.00 $ 397,999.00
Killen, AL

Summit Waterproofing, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pelham AL

GKL Companies, Inc. $ 286,487.00 $ 12,000.00 $ 298,487.00
Rainbow City, AL

Florence Readiness Center Re-roof
Florence, AL

IFB # AC-11-B-0013-S
11. 2011 at 2:00

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL OF

THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT I HAVE VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT

AND FOUND IT CORRECT.

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE THIS DATE WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE BIDS.

LAD~A J. DENNIS
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