

BID ABSTRACT

CALERA - REROOF and ORGANIZATIONAL PARKING EXPANSION

Calera Readiness Center 1320 8th Avenue, Calera, AL
 IFB # AC-12-B-0023-S

13-Sep-12

General Contractor	Base Bid	ALTERNATE #1	ALTERNATE #2	ALTERNATE #3	ALTERNATE #4
BATTLE MILLER CONSTRUCTION	\$ 294,800.00	\$ 80,000.00	\$ 41,000.00	\$ 18,000.00	\$ 6,000.00
BULLARD-COOK, INC	NO BID				
DUNCAN & THOMPSON CONSTRUCTION	NO BID				
HALE BUILDING COMPANY, INC	\$ 268,876.00	\$ 31,455.00	\$ 18,578.00	\$ 12,840.00	\$ 5,198.00
METRO D CONSTRUCTION, LLC	\$ 267,797.00	\$ 32,597.00	\$ 22,268.00	\$ 6,752.00	\$ 2,086.00
PARK LANE CONSTRUCTION, LLC	NO BID				
PEMBERTON, INC	\$ 278,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 36,000.00	\$ 6,000.00
WIREGRASS CONSTRUCTION, INC	NO BID				

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT I HAVE VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.


 MARK A. WEEKS, SPDO

Sept 13, 2012

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE THIS DATE WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE BIDS.


 LADONNA DENNIS

Sept 13, 2012