ABSTRACT OF BIDS:

WAC CIRCLE

POV PARKING CONSTRUCTION - FT MCCLELLAN, ANNISTON, ALABAMA
IFB# AC-11-B-0036-S

Birmingham, Alabama

September 15, 2011

BIDDERS BASE BID Alternate No. 1 TOTAL
Boatner nowm:ﬁncos 299,440.00 12,225.00 $311,665.00
Rainbow City, Alabama
Bradshaw & Pitts 252,200.00 18,750.00 $270,950.00
Anniston, Alabama
Forsyth Building Company 201,222.00 20,500.00 $221,722.00
Anniston, Alabama
Hale Building Company 232,244.00 13,367.00 $245,611.00
Anniston, Alabama
Holmes II Excavation NO BID NO BID NO BID
Munford, Alabama
James E. Swzm & Sons Contractors 295,220.00 36,818.00 $332,038.00
Rainbow City, Alabama
John F. Morgan General Contractor 238,300.00 15,014.00 $253,314.00
Anniston, Alabama
McCartney Construction 246,734.00 17,668.00 $264,402.00
Gadsden, Alabama
Walker Patton Company NO BID NO BID NO BID

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS

AND THAT I HAVE VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.

MARK A. WEEKS, SPDO

15-Sep-2011

Date

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE THIS DATE WITNESSED THE
OPENING OF THE ABOVE BIDS.
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LADONNA J. DENNIS

15-Sep-2011
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