ABSTRACT OF BIDS:

New Metal Storage Building--Goodwater, AL
IFB # AC-11-B-0030-S
September 8, 2011 at 2:00 pm

BIDDERS

BASE BID

TOTAL

AAA General Contractors, Inc.
Alexander City, AL

338,236.00

$ 338,236.00

ACI Building Systems
Batesville, MS

NO BID

NO BID

Amity Construction Company
Montgomery, AL

316,600.00

$ 316,600.00

Bob Smith Construction, Inc.
Trussville, AL

NO BID

NO BID

Bradshaw & Pitts, LLC
Anniston, AL

352,200.00

$ 352,200.00

Bullard - Cook, Inc.
Montgomery, AL

340,000.00

$ 340,000.00

CRL - Lovelady Construction, LLC
Selma, AL

296,700.00

$ 296,700.00

Hale Building Company, Inc.
Anniston, AL

349,167.00

$ 349,167.00

Henderson and Coker
Alexander City, AL

295,682.00

$ 295,682.00

Hurst Construction LLC
Oxford, AL

268,900.00

$ 268,900.00

M.J. Brooks & Son Construction, Inc.
Sylacauga, AL

298,500.00

$ 298,500.00

Metro D Construction, LLC
Talladega, AL

338,949.00

$ 338,949.00

Pro-Tech Metal, Inc.
Rainbow City, AL

NO BID

NO BID

Shook Whorton Construction Co., LLC
Montgomery, AL

338,371.00

$ 338,371.00

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED
AND READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND
THAT I HAVE VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND
FOUND IT CORRECT.

MWy fr

(MARK A. WEEKS, SPDO
8-Sep-11

Date

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE THIS DATE
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE
BIDS.
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LADONNAY. DENNIS
8-Sep-2011

Date




