ABSTRACT OF BIDS:

Fayette Readiness Center Re-roof
Fayette, AL

IFB # AC-11-B-0020-S
August 25, 2011 at 2:00 pm

BIDDERS

BASE BID

TOTAL

ACME Roofing & Sheet Metal
Dothan, AL

294,300.00

294,300.00

Alabama Roofing & Sheet Metal
Anniston, AL

288,388.00

288,388.00

Atlas Builders & Roofing, Inc.
Killen, AL

NO BID

NO BID

Crimson Eagle, Inc.
Tuscaloosa, AL

330,330.00

330,330.00

Deason Roofing & Sheet Metal Contractors,
Inc.

279,734.00

279,734.00

Graham Roofing, Inc.
West Point, MS

541,943.00

341,943.00

Hale Building Company, Inc.
Anniston, AL

323,883.00

323,883.00

Interstate Roofing, Inc.
Montgomery, AL
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259,200.00
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259,200.00

J. J. Morely Enterprises
Birmingham, AL

NO BID

NO BID

Johns & Kirksey, Inc.
Tuscaloosa, AL

NO BID

NO BID

Miller Roofing, Inc.
Jasper, AL

NO BID

NO BID

Norman Enterprises, Inc.
Meridian, MS

302,200.00

302,200.00

Standard Roofing of Montgomery, Inc.
Pelham, AL

285,698.00

285,698.00

Summit Waterproofing, Inc.
Pelham, AL

NO BID

NO BID

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED
AND READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT I
HAVE VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT

CORRECT.
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ﬁixx A. WEEKS, SPDO
25-Aug-11

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE THIS DATE
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE
BIDS.

PN
nJ ?\EE @/@p\??af

Date

LADONNA J. DENNIS
25-Aug-2011
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