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BIDDERS BASE BID ALTERNATE NO. 1 | ALTERNATE NO. 2 | ALTERNATE NO. 3 | ALTERNATE NO. 4 TOTAL
Amity Construction NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, AL
BullasgiCoi nC. $ 136,200.00 | $ 65,900.00 | $ 83,200.00 | $ 21,300.00 | ¢ 30,000.00 336,600.00
Montgomery, AL ! ! ! ! ! e
Green-Simmons
Company $ 167,604.00 | $ 46,836.00 | $ 118,639.00 | $ 39,534.00 | $ 65,845.00 438,458.00
Pensacola, FL
Hale Building Company
Arniston, Al $ 90,633.00 | $ 62,268.00 | $ 88,212.00 | $ 24,205.00 | $ 38,419.00 303,737.00
Hughes Brothers
Construction NO BID NO BID
Dothan, AL

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND
READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT I HAVE
VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.

e

( MARK A. WEEKS, SPDO

29-Sep-2011

Date

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE THIS DATE
WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE
BIDS.

N

0 O?E@fm:@?.&%

LADONNA J.([DENNIS

29-Sep-2011

Date




