ABSTRACT OF BIDS:

Birmingham AFRC Re-roof
Birmingham, AL

IFB # AC-11-B-0017-S
August 25, 2011 at 2:00 pm

Pelham, AL

BIDDERS BASE BID TOTAL
ACME Roofing & Sheet Metal
27,400. 400,
Dothan, AL $ 527,400.00 | $ 527,400.00
Alabama Roofing & Sheet Metal $ 530,630.00 | $ 530.630.00
Anniston, AL 199K ,050.
All - South Subcontractors, Inc. NO BID NO BID
Birmingham, AL
Atlas Builders & Roofing, Inc. NO BID NO BID
Killen, AL
Battle Miller Construction Corporation $ 571,800.00 | $ 571.800.00
Hoover, AL il geia
Ben Hill Roofing & Siding Company, Inc. NO BID NO BID
Douglasville, GA
Double AA Construction Company 559.000.0
Wilmer, AL $ ,000.00 | $ 559,000.00
GKL Companies, Inc.
! 593,490.00 ,490.
Rainbow City, AL $ i SE
Hale Building Company, Inc. $ 521,485.00 | $ 521 485.00
Anniston, AL ' /
Interstate Roofing, Inc.
! 477,800.00 477,800.
Montgomery, AL $ 3 e
J. J. Morely Enterprises NO BID NO BID
Birmingham, AL
Standard Roofing of Montgomery, Inc. 540.047.00
Pelham, AL 3 ,047.00 | $ 540,047.00
Summit Waterproofing, Inc. NO BID NO BID

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED
AND READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT I
HAVE VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT

CORRECT.

ARK A. WEEKS, SPDO
25-Aug-11

Date

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE THIS DATE WITNESSED

THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE BIDS.

- |
/%8@@?? p@f«ﬁ%

LADONNA J. DENNIS

25-Aug-2011

Date




