BID ABSTRACT

RENOVATION AND SHELL REPAIR BUILDING 2278
Ft. McClellan, Anniston, Alabama
IFB NO: AC-12-B-0027-C

13-Sep-12
General Contractor Base Bid ALTERNATE #1 ALTERNATE #2

Barclay Contracting, Inc. NC BID

gﬁ;’;"{;ﬁ :ansticuon $ 417,800.00 | 10,000.00 | § 8,000.00
Forsyth Building Company $ 274,600.00 | $ 6,966.00 | % 7,913.00
Hale Building Company $ 308,108.00 | % 8,130.00 | $ 741,00
Hurst Construction LLC $ 283,000,00 | $ 9,900.00 | % 8,800.00
iscﬂcrgan General Contractar, NO BID

Kilgore Construction $ 265,300.00 | $ 5,400.00 | $ 3,700.00
Nationview LLC NO BID

Shook Whorton Construction NO BID

Sprouse Construction NO BID

Trawick Contractors, Inc. NO BID

}E ROREIMGICR SoOpanY, |y 238,000.00 | $ 5,900,00 | $ 10,000.00
READ ALL OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT | HAVE ' THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE BIDS. -

VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.

MARK A KS, SPDO September 13, 2012 LaDonna Dennis  September 13, 2012




