
ABSTRACT OF BIDS:
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BIDDERS BASE BID ALTERNATE #1 TOTAL

MG Roofing, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID
Muscle Shoals, AL

Standard Roofing of Montgomery, Inc. $ 358,164.00 $ 6,000.00 $ 364,164.00
Pelham, AL

Hale Building Company, Inc. $ 456,066.00 $ 2,798.00 $ 458,864.00
Anniston, AL

Double AA Construction Company NO BID NO BID NO BID
Wilmer, AL

ACME Roofing & Sheet Metal $ 281,000.00 $ 3,600.00 $ 284,600.00
Dothan, AL

Alabama Roofing & Sheet Metal $ 384,000.00 $ 3,800.00 $ 387,800.00
Anniston, AL

Ben Hill Roofing & Siding Company, Inc. $ 366,555.00 $ 8,175.00 $ 374,730.00
Douglasville, GA

Interstate Roofing, Inc. $ 334,700.00 $ 4,000.00 $ 338,700.00
Montgomery, AL

Premier Structures, Inc. $ 337,334.00 $ 3,233.00 $ 340,567.00
Athens, AL

Atlas Builders & Roofing, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID
Killen, AL

Summit Waterproofing, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID
Pelham, AL

KC Construction $ 317,510.00 $ 7,600.00 $ 325,110.00
Dothan, AL

GKL Companies, Inc. $ 306,863.00 $ 12,000.00 $ 318,863.00
Rainbow City, AL

Athens Readiness Center Re-roof
Athens, AL
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I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL
OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT I HAVE VERIFIED THE
ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.
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