BID ABSTRACT

Renovations & Alterations to BUILDING 1333

PROJECT:
Ft. McClellan Army National Guard Training Center, Anniston, AL
IFB # : AC-12-B-0001-S
Bid Opening Date: April 5, 2012 2:00 p.m.
Location: Conference Room (Room 201) of the State Military Department, 1720 Congressman W. L. Dickinson Drive, Montgomery, Alabama
[Total of 1 Addendum
General . . Bid Item #2 - TOTAL
Base Bid - Item #1 Base Bid - Item #2 .

Contractor Alternate #1 Bid Item #2 TOTAL BID
Birmingham Industrial 409,000.00 399,900.00 137,000.00 536,900.00 | $ 945,900.00
Constructlpn_

Blalock Building Company NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Trussville, AL

Boatner Construction

Reintiow Q. AL 418,400.00 381,900.00 43,400.00 425,300.00 | $ 843,700.00
Bradshaw & Pitts, LLC 353,000.00 380,000.00 75,000.00 455,000.00 | $ 808,000.00
Anniston, AL

i3 Beooks &Hon 399,400.00 443,000.00 141,000.00 584,000.00 | $ 983,400.00
Constructhn ;

Forsyth Building Company 346,200.00 372,000.00 82,600.00 454,600.00 | $ 800,800.00
Annnstor_l, AL

Hale Building Company 377,509.00 329,640.00 54,428.00 384,068.00 | $ 761,577.00
Anniston, AL

Hurst Construction

by 340,000.00 384,000.00 59,000.00 443,000.00 | $ 783,000.00
JF Morgan General NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Contractors
InAsco

. 392,954.00 380,362.00 138,985.00 519,347.00 | $ 912,301.00

Anniston. AL

Pemberton, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Montgomery, AL

TDR Construction 437,553.00 456,648.00 155,150.00 611,798.00 | $ 1,049,351.00
Company

Metro D Construction 397,727.00 358,841.00 61,497.00 420,338.00 | $ 818,065.00

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL
OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT I HAVE VERIFIED THE
ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.

— N jole

'MARK A. WEEKS, SPDO

5-Apr-2012

I CERTIFY THAT I HAVE THIS DATE WITNESSED THE

OPENING OF THE ABOVE BIDS.

EQ\ Q'»(,g vl Q(&WL

LADONNA J. DENNIS

5-Apr-2012

Date




