ABSTRACT OF BIDS
Jacksonville Motorpool and Drainage Improvements

Jacksonville, AL
IFB # AC-11-B-0008-S
July 28, 2011 at 2:00 pm
BIDDERS BASE BID ALTERNATE #1 ALTERNATE #2 TOTAL
James E. Watts & Sons Contractors, Inc. $ 291,578.00 | $ 21,13652 | § 14,529.00 | $ 327,24352
Rainbow City, AL
fy{fff;c"nsﬂ'““i‘m Co. Inc. $ 246,700.00 | § 30,400.00 | § 13,150.00 | $ 290,250.00
Hale Building Company, Inc. $ (110,606.00)| $ (75,178.00)| $ (79,495.00)
Anniston, AL $ 300,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 | $ 100,000.00 | $ 234,721.00
g:dcuﬂ‘ey Construction Company, Inc. $ 283,290.00 | $ 30,720.00 | § 21,300.00 | § 335,310.00
isden,
Strain Construction Co. $ 205,503.43 | § 18,817.28 | § 16,18354 | § 240,504.25
Woodland, AL
Walker Patton Company, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
| Birmingham, AL
Bradshaw & Pitts, LLC $ (326,200.00)
Ansiston, AL $ 500,000.00 | $ 19,700.00 | $ 10,400.00 | $ 203,900.00
1 CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL OF THE ABOVE 8IDS AND THAT | HAVE VERIFIED THE 1 CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE
ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT. ABOVE BIDS.
( MARK A, WEEKS, SPDO LADONNA ), DE
28-Jul-11 28-Jul-11
Date Date
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