ABSTRACT OF BIDS

South Region Indoor Firing Range Conversions to Storage

ARNG Readiness Centers - Brantley, Hartford, and Florala, AL
IFB # AC-11-B-0006-S

July 21, 2011 at 2:00 pm
BIDDERS Brantley Hartford Florala TOTAL BASE BID
A :
ishcnpraty, e $ 62,625.00 | $ 45,275.00 | $ 54,286.00 | 162,186.00
Birmingham, AL
Femberton, Inc. $ 48,000.00 | $ 37,000.00 | $ 31,000.00 | $ 116,000.00
Montgomery, AL
Zedot Construction, Inc. $ 48,590.00 | $ 38,111.00 | $ 27,382.00 | $ 114,083.00
Wetumpka, AL
H.este'r Clu‘:mstuction, Inc. $ (3,000.00)| $ (3,000.00)| $ 3,000.00) $ 121,864.00
Birmingham, AL $ 53,038.00 | $ 43,222.00 | $ 34,604.00
Hale Building Company, Inc. $ (94,331.00)| $ (111,080.00)| $ (126,725.00) § 117.864.00
Anniston, AL $ 15000000 |$  150,000.00 |$  150,000.00 :
Dan't Efwuonmental, Inc. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Louisville, KY
Lewis & Associates Construction
Company, Inc. Dothan, AL $ 48,249.00 | $ 38,149.00 | $ 32,656.00 | $ 119,054.00

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL OF THE ABOVE
BIDS AND THAT | HAVE VERIFIED THE ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.
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/ MARK A. WEEKS, SPDO

21-Jul-11
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| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE WITNESSED THE OPENING OF THE ABOVE

BIDS,
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LADONNA_J. DENNIS

21-Jul-11

Date




