ABSTRACT OF BIDS

PROJECT:

BID OPENING DATE:

Eastern Enclave Fence Relocation / Construction, Fort McClellan, AL

IFB# AC-11-B-0007-S

14 July 2011 at 2:00 p.m. Local Time

LOCATION: Conference Room (Room 201) of the State Military Department, 1720 Cong. W.L. Dicksinson Drive, Montgomery, AL
) ABI #1 ABI #2
Base B
= New double 12' gates Additional fence at south west end Total
American Imperial Fence
S 33,693.00| 2,916.00] 13,522.00} 50,131.00]
Decatur. AL 35603 ° > >
Bradshaw & Pitts, LL.C
: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Oxford, AL 36203 '
Columbus Fence Co. $ 48,300.00] $ 1,625.00] $ 21,630.00] $ 71,555.00
Columbus, MS 39702 i . R PR
Fincher Fence Inc. J
26,800.00 950.00 4,650.00 32,400.00
Roanoke, AL 36274 > » | > | °
Hale Building Co. Inc. S (10,749.00)] 5 (3,598.00) $ (2,527.00) $ 63.126.00|
Anniston, AL 36202 $ 50,000.00{ $ 5,000.00f $ 25,000.00| T
Hurst Construction | I
: - 64,170.00 3,093.50 17,968.00 85,231.50]
Lineville, AL 36266 » ° ’ $
Model City P & M
. 82,913.00 3,509.00 31,936.00) 118,358.00
Anniston, Al 36201 » » | ° ’ '
Sullivan Enterprises, Inc.
> NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Magee, MS 39111
Tennessee Valley Fence, Inc.
s ’ NO BID NO BID NO BID| NO BID
Huntsville, AL 35805
Fencemart Inc.
) 26,500.00 410.00 10,200.00 37,110.00
Hamilton, AL, 35570 ” | ® . |®

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE PERSONALLY OPENED AND READ ALL
OF THE ABOVE BIDS AND THAT | HAVE VERIFIED THE
ABSTRACT AND FOUND IT CORRECT.

W/W-
( ARK A. WEEKS, SPDO

14-jul-11

Date

| CERTIFY THAT | HAVE THIS DATE WITNESSED THE
OPENING OF THE ABOVE BIDS.

LA

AANA

14-jul-11

NA J. DENNIS
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Date



